Bids Received for Unleaded Gasoline
(Tax not included)*

February 18, 2022-—- 10:00 A.M.

Fixed Price on
Unleaded Per

Fixed Price on
Unleaded Per

Fixed Price on
Unleaded Per

Gallon - 3 Gallon - 6 Gallon - 12
FIRM Months Months Months
River Valley
Cooperative - Geneseo No bid No bid 3.25
Gold Star FS, Inc. -
Cambridge 3.13 3.07 3.01
Woodhull Oil
Company—Woodhull 2.96 2.92 2 J7

*Taxes on gasoline currently paid by the School District are .201 per gallon.

The District is currently completing a twelve (12) month contract for unleaded fuel from River

Valley Cooperative for $2.11 per gallon.

I recommend that the Geneseo Board of Education accept the fixed bid
price for unleaded fuel for a twelve (12) month time frame from the

Woodhull Oil Company @ $2.77 per gallon.

Unleaded gasoline will be re-advertised in early February 2023.

Tim Gronski, CSBO




Bids Received for Diesel Fuel
(Tax not included)*
February 28, 2022 - 10:00 A.M.

Fixed Price
Fixed Price on on Road Fixed Price on
Road Diesel Diesel Per Road Diesel
Per Gallon Gallon Per Gallon
FIRM 3 Months 6 Months 12 Months
Gold Star FS, Inc. -
Cambridge, IL Reg.: $3.33 Reg.: $3.33 No bid
River Valley Cooperative,
Geneseo, IL No bid No bid Reg.:$3.52
Win.:$3.77
Woodhull Oil Company,
Woodhull, IL Reg.: $3.20 Reg.:$3.15 Reg.:$3.09
Win.:$3.12

*Taxes on diesel fuel currently paid by the School District are $.47 per gallon

The District is currently completing a 12 month contract with the Woodhull Oil Company
for $2.19 per gallon.

I recommend that the Geneseo Board of Education accept the 12-month fixed bid price
from Woodhull Oil Company for regular blend diesel fuel at $3.09 per gallon and winter

blend diesel at $3.12 per gallon.

Diesel fuel bids will be re-advertised in mid-February 2023.

Tim Gronski, CSBO



